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The sixteen-volume Handbook of Middle American Indians, completed in 1976, has been acclaimed the
world over as the single most valuable resource ever produced for those involved in the study of
Mesoamerica. When it was determined in 1978 that the Handbook should be updated periodically, Victoria
Reifler Bricker, well-known cultural anthropologist, was elected to be general editor.

This fourth volume of the Supplement is devoted to colonial ethnohistory. Four of the eleven chapters review
research and ethnohistorical resources for Guatemala, South Yucatan, North Yucatan, and Oaxaca, areas that
received less attention than the central Mexican area in the original Guide to Ethnohistorical Sources (HMAI
vols. 12-15).

Six substantive and problem-oriented studies cover the use of colonial texts in the study of pre-colonial
Mayan languages; political and economic organization in the valleys of Mexico, Puebla-Tlaxcala, and
Morelos; urban-rural relations in the Basin of Mexico; kinship and social organization in colonial
Tenochtitlan; tlamemes and transport in colonial central Mexico; and land tenure and titles in central Mexico
as reflected in colonial codices.
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From reader reviews:

Norris Patterson:

The feeling that you get from Supplement to the Handbook of Middle American Indians, Volume 4:
Ethnohistory may be the more deep you looking the information that hide in the words the more you get
interested in reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to be aware of but Supplement to the Handbook
of Middle American Indians, Volume 4: Ethnohistory giving you joy feeling of reading. The writer conveys
their point in certain way that can be understood by means of anyone who read the idea because the author of
this reserve is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your current vocabulary increase well.
Making it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest
you for having that Supplement to the Handbook of Middle American Indians, Volume 4: Ethnohistory
instantly.

Alfonso Miller:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't judge book by its deal with may
doesn't work is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside
search likes. Maybe you answer can be Supplement to the Handbook of Middle American Indians, Volume
4: Ethnohistory why because the great cover that make you consider concerning the content will not
disappoint an individual. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading
6th sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Angela Rodriguez:

Reading a book to become new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to read a book. When you
learn a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts
of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your study, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics,
and also soon. The Supplement to the Handbook of Middle American Indians, Volume 4: Ethnohistory
provide you with a new experience in reading through a book.

Beverly Thomas:

In this particular era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more
valuable than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What
you should do is just spending your time little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of the
books in the top list in your reading list is actually Supplement to the Handbook of Middle American
Indians, Volume 4: Ethnohistory. This book which can be qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer
in turning into precious person. By looking upward and review this publication you can get many



advantages.
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