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Clustering is the final component of MySQL that makes it truly enterprise-level and able to compete fully
with proprietary databases such as Oracle and Microsoft SQL Server. The increased number of high-demand,
high-productivity corporations and institutions choosing MySQL, including MIT, the Department of
Homeland Security, NASA, and Nokia, to name a few, need the benefit of clustering databases for high
performance and scalability.
 
MySQL AB has stepped up to the plate to offer advanced, high-availability, reliable clustering. As this
demand has increased, so has the need for information. MySQL Clustering offers thorough, authoritative
instruction on setting up and administering a MySQL Cluster from the developers of the cluster itself. You
will learn about everything from installation and configuration to performance and troubleshooting in this
authoritative reference guide to MySQL clustering.
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From reader reviews:

Richard McCain:

Throughout other case, little individuals like to read book MySQL Clustering. You can choose the best book
if you like reading a book. Providing we know about how is important the book MySQL Clustering. You can
add information and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from
book you can know everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will end up known.
About simple point until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or
maybe searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel fed up to go to the
library. Let's read.

Gregory Jones:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they are still students or this for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every
person has various personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't would like do that. You must know how great as well as important the book MySQL Clustering. All
type of book can you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Gary Johnson:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone at everywhere.
The information can be a know-how or any news even a concern. What people must be consider any time
those information which is inside the former life are challenging be find than now is taking seriously which
one is appropriate to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take MySQL Clustering as your daily resource
information.

Irving Dorn:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book method, more simple and reachable. That MySQL Clustering can give you a lot of friends because by
you checking out this one book you have issue that they don't and make a person more like an interesting
person. That book can be one of a step for you to get success. This reserve offer you information that
possibly your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than additional make you to be great people. So ,
why hesitate? We should have MySQL Clustering.
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