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Lincoln's Gettysburg Address
President Lincoln delivered the Gettysburg Address on November 19, 1863. It was reprinted in various
newspapers and pamphlets and separately as a broadside. A very close reading reveals more than a dozen
punctuational and substantive differences between the two printings reproduced here. On the left is the
version authorized by the Soldiers' National Cemetery Association at Gettysburg, printed in January 1864.
On the right is the first separate printing of Lincoln's speech, published in New York in March 1864 as a
fundraiser for the New York Metropolitan Sanitary Fair. (Left: Address of Hon Edward Everett, at the
Consecration of the National Cemetery at Gettysburg. Boston: Little, Brown and Company, 1864. Right: The
President's Dedication Address at Gettysburg. New York: Miller and Mathews, [1864]. [The Gilder Lehrman
Collection]) These posters are 22" x 30", full color, and printed on a semi-gloss white stock. Each one
features a caption that places the image in historical context.
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From reader reviews:

Hazel Polk:

With other case, little individuals like to read book Lincoln's Gettysburg Address. You can choose the best
book if you love reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important any book Lincoln's
Gettysburg Address. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by way of a book.
Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can recognize everything! From your country till foreign or
abroad you will find yourself known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you could know that. In this
era, we can open a book or searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel
uninterested to go to the library. Let's examine.

Paul Cockrell:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try and and must have the free time or they will get lot of
stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely
yes. People is human not really a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are there when the
spare time coming to a person of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you ever try this
one, reading books. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the actual book you have read
is actually Lincoln's Gettysburg Address.

Rudy Lapan:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Lincoln's Gettysburg Address book
written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that may be understand by anyone
who have read the book. Written within good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and creating
skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still doubt Lincoln's Gettysburg Address as good book but
not only by the cover but also by content. This is one book that can break don't determine book by its deal
with, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense
already said so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Patsy Cassella:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will
make a professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended to you personally is Lincoln's Gettysburg Address this book consist a lot of the information
with the condition of this world now. This particular book was represented how does the world has grown
up. The terminology styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some
investigation when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book suitable all of you.
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