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The early history of New London County has been well covered by Miss Caulkin's histories of Norwich, and
of New London, in various local addresses on special occasions, and in more formal articles prepared for the
200th anniversary of the founding of Norwich. Notable amongst these was the historical address of Daniel
Coit Gilman, delivered at Norwich on September 7, 1859. To enumerate the special papers delivered at the
meetings of the New London County Historical Society, at the dedication of monuments and public
buildings of the county, on patriotic occasions, on the 250th anniversary of the town of Norwich (1909), and
in almost countless addresses on special topics given before interested audiences in churches and halls, not to
mention the many excellent contributions of the press, would in itself be an arduous task, interesting though
it might be.

Very few parts of our country are more filled with historical associations. Indian legends, mingled with a
vast amount of verifiable Indian history; Revolutionary stories, with a record of honorable action surpassed
nowhere; loyal patriotism in the days of the Civil War, under the leadership of Governor Buckingham,
himself a resident of Norwich, all these offer a wealth of material to the investigator. Out of the great mass of
historical writings inspired by such a splendid past there looms up a background, a heritage of memories, that
should urge on every citizen of New London County today to better citizenship, to more devoted public
service.

From some of these records and addresses we have quoted - they were written by men and women who were
near the events described - for we believe that true patriotism is a deep sentiment toward one's native land,
not simply a series of outward acts. This abiding sentiment of affection and unselfishness in a people, as in
an individual, is rooted in memory. By the memory of earlier days, by knowledge of the sacrifices of earlier
patriots who made liberty possible for us, will the true spirit of Americanism be best nourished. Nor is the
Indian history without value. Even if, in the light of history, "the noble red man" of Cooper's novels seems a
somewhat idealized figure, surely nowhere else in America may be found a better typical picture of the early
relations of the white settler and the aborigine. We see them both at their best and at their worst. We have the
grim picture of John Mason as he leads his resolute forces on to the utter destruction of the Pequots, and we
have the picture of Uncas in all things, "Wauregan," living in unbroken amity with the Norwich colonists; we
learn of Samson Occum, the Mohican who visited England and brought back ten thousand pounds to
Dartmouth College. The present work, then, aims to emphasize only such features of the early history of our
country as are helpful to the modern reader in visualizing the days of occupation, of settlement, and colonial
development, the essential background by which to emphasize modern conditions.

Our history for the last fifty years, inasmuch as this has not been printed in any one volume, will be
described with greater minuteness.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Cardona:

Book will be written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Next to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A e-book A Modern History of New London County,
Connecticut, Vol. 1 (Classic Reprint) will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel more confidence if
you can know about everything. But some of you think in which open or reading any book make you bored.
It is not make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or
appropriate book with you?

Wesley Powell:

The reserve with title A Modern History of New London County, Connecticut, Vol. 1 (Classic Reprint)
contains a lot of information that you can study it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. That book
exist new know-how the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world at this
point. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you
throughout new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the
idea anywhere you want.

Linda Griffin:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book particularly book entitled A
Modern History of New London County, Connecticut, Vol. 1 (Classic Reprint) your head will drift away
trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe not known for but surely might be your mind
friends. Imaging every single word written in a reserve then become one contact form conclusion and
explanation that will maybe you never get just before. The A Modern History of New London County,
Connecticut, Vol. 1 (Classic Reprint) giving you an additional experience more than blown away your head
but also giving you useful data for your better life in this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing
pattern the following is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning
a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Roberta Lawrence:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many question for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people
likes reading through, not only science book but in addition novel and A Modern History of New London
County, Connecticut, Vol. 1 (Classic Reprint) or others sources were given know-how for you. After you
know how the great a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or
even students especially. Those books are helping them to bring their knowledge. In various other case,
beside science guide, any other book likes A Modern History of New London County, Connecticut, Vol. 1



(Classic Reprint) to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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