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The Scottish urbanist and biologist Patrick Geddes (1854-1932) is perhaps best known for introducing the
concept of "region" to architecture and planning. At the turn of the twentieth century, he was one of the
strongest advocates of town planning and an active participant in debates about the future of the city. He was
arguably the first planner to recognize the importance of historic city centers, and his renewal work in
Edinburghï¿½s Old Town is visible and impressive to this day.Geddes's famous analytical triad--place, work,
and folk, corresponding to the geographical, historical, and spiritual aspects of the city--provides the basic
structure of this examination of his urban theory. Volker Welter examines Geddesï¿½s ideas in the light of
nineteenth-century biology--in which Geddes received his academic trainingï¿½-showing Geddesï¿½s use of
biological concepts to be far more sophisticated than popular images of the city as an organic entity. His
urbanism was informed by his lifelong interest in the theory of evolution and in ecology, cutting-edge areas
in the late nineteenth century. Balancing Geddesï¿½s biological thought is his interest in the historical Greek
concept of polis, usually translated as city-state but implying a view of the city as a cultural and spiritual
phenomenon.Although Geddesï¿½s work was far-ranging, the city provided the unifying focus of nearly all
of his theoretical and practical work. Throughout the book, Welter relates Geddesï¿½s theory of the city to
contemporary European debates about architecture and urbanism.
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From reader reviews:

Jim Martin:

This Biopolis: Patrick Geddes and the City of Life book is just not ordinary book, you have after that it the
world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is information inside this e-book
incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get.
This kind of Biopolis: Patrick Geddes and the City of Life without we realize teach the one who reading
through it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't be worry Biopolis: Patrick Geddes and the
City of Life can bring whenever you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' turn out to be full
because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even telephone. This Biopolis: Patrick Geddes and the City
of Life having excellent arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Jennifer Mendoza:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information presently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider whenever those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now could be
taking seriously which one would work to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you
find the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for
you. All of those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Biopolis: Patrick Geddes and the City of
Life as the daily resource information.

Carlton Solley:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make anyone to
understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information quicker to share.
You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon.
You can see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended for you is Biopolis: Patrick Geddes and the City of Life this publication consist a lot of the
information from the condition of this world now. That book was represented how do the world has grown
up. The terminology styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made
some research when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book appropriate all of you.

Romana Linder:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is identified
as of book Biopolis: Patrick Geddes and the City of Life. You can add your knowledge by it. Without
leaving the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most
critical that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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