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A gripping novel about the assassination of Leon Trotsky in Mexico City in 1940

In The Man Who Loved Dogs, Leonardo Padura brings a noir sensibility to one of the most fascinating and
complex political narratives of the past hundred years: the assassination of Leon Trotsky by Ramón
Mercader.

The story revolves around Iván Cárdenas Maturell, who in his youth was the great hope of modern Cuban
literature?until he dared to write a story that was deemed counterrevolutionary. When we meet him years
later in Havana, Iván is a loser: a humbled and defeated man with a quiet, unremarkable life who earns his
modest living as a proofreader at a veterinary magazine. One afternoon, he meets a mysterious foreigner in
the company of two Russian wolfhounds. This is "the man who loved dogs," and as the pair grow closer,
Iván begins to understand that his new friend is hiding a terrible secret.
Moving seamlessly between Iván's life in Cuba, Ramón's early years in Spain and France, and Trotsky's long
years of exile, The Man Who Loved Dogs is Padura's most ambitious and brilliantly executed novel yet. This
is a story about political ideals tested and characters broken, a multilayered epic that effortlessly weaves
together three different plot threads? Trotsky in exile, Ramón in pursuit, Iván in frustrated stasis?to bring
emotional truth to historical fact.
A novel whose reach is matched only by its astonishing successes on the page, The Man Who Loved Dogs
lays bare the human cost of abstract ideals and the insidious, corrosive effects of life under a repressive
political regime.
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From reader reviews:

David Gaytan:

Do you one of people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys this
aren't like that. This The Man Who Loved Dogs: A Novel book is readable through you who hate the straight
word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience without leaving also
decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer of The Man Who Loved Dogs: A Novel
content conveys thinking easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
information but it just different in the form of it. So , do you still thinking The Man Who Loved Dogs: A
Novel is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Beth Johnson:

Typically the book The Man Who Loved Dogs: A Novel will bring you to the new experience of reading a
book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to learn, this book
very acceptable to you. The book The Man Who Loved Dogs: A Novel is much recommended to you to
read. You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Heidi Crenshaw:

The reserve with title The Man Who Loved Dogs: A Novel includes a lot of information that you can study
it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This book exist new know-how the information that
exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to understand
how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you within new era of the syndication. You
can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Doris Avey:

Within this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
valuable than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you need
to do is just spending your time little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. On the list of books in
the top list in your reading list is definitely The Man Who Loved Dogs: A Novel. This book that is qualified
as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking right up and review this e-
book you can get many advantages.
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