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The Wild Parrots of Telegraph Hill is the inspiring story of how one man found his life’s work—and true
love—among a gang of wild parrots roosting in one of America’s most picturesque urban settings.

Mark Bittner was down on his luck. He’d gone to San Francisco at the age of twenty-one to take a stab at a
music career, but he hadn’t had much success. After many years as an odd-jobber in the area, he accepted
work as a housekeeper for an elderly woman. The gig came with a rent-free studio apartment on the city’s
famed Telegraph Hill, which had somehow become home to a flock of brilliantly colored wild parrots.

In this unforgettable story, Bittner recounts how he became fascinated by the birds and made up his mind to
get to know them and gain their trust. He succeeds to such a degree that he becomes the local wild parrot
expert and a tourist attraction. People can’t help gawking at the man who, during daily feedings, stands with
parrots perched along both arms and atop his head. When a documentary filmmaker comes along to capture
the phenomenon on film, the story takes a surprising turn, and Bittner’s life truly takes flight.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Sims:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book and so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a e-book you will get new information mainly because book is one of numerous
ways to share the information or their idea. Second, reading through a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you looking at a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to
definitely imagine the story how the character types do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your
knowledge to others. When you read this The Wild Parrots of Telegraph Hill: A Love Story . . .with Wings,
you could tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire
average, make them reading a e-book.

Fannie Wymer:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the time or they will get lot of
stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely
sure. People is human not a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you possess when the spare
time coming to a person of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one, reading
books. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the book you have read is The Wild
Parrots of Telegraph Hill: A Love Story . . .with Wings.

Richard Valadez:

Beside this specific The Wild Parrots of Telegraph Hill: A Love Story . . .with Wings in your phone, it could
give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge
you may got here is fresh from the oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an aged people live in
narrow small town. It is good thing to have The Wild Parrots of Telegraph Hill: A Love Story . . .with Wings
because this book offers for you readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you would not get
what it's all about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable
arrangement here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss this?
Find this book along with read it from at this point!

Rachel Glidewell:

Some individuals said that they feel bored when they reading a guide. They are directly felt it when they get
a half areas of the book. You can choose the actual book The Wild Parrots of Telegraph Hill: A Love Story .
. .with Wings to make your current reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading talent is
developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy you just read it and
mingle the sensation about book and looking at especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to open
a book and read it. Beside that the e-book The Wild Parrots of Telegraph Hill: A Love Story . . .with Wings



can to be your new friend when you're feel alone and confuse with what must you're doing of these time.
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