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Kelli McCabe is a no nonsense detective with a tough exterior. Only a select few know her as a loyal, loving
friend. Committed to her family, her friends, and her job, Kelli puts her needs behind everyone else's.

As a surgeon, Nora Whitmore is used to being in control. The hospital is her life and leaves room for little
else. Respected by her colleagues, but misunderstood by the residents, Nora takes what she needs and keeps
everyone at arm's length. In the process, she creates unexpected enemies.
Tragedy brings them together. As chaos grows around them, the lines between them begin to blur. Despite
being from different worlds, friendship grows between them, turning quickly to attraction. Will these two
strong, independent women find a way to deal with their individual baggage? Or will they be overcome by
it?
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From reader reviews:

Homer Anderson:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, planning to
beach, or picnic inside the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Will you something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? May be reading a book might be option to fill your cost-free
time/ holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
consider look for book, may be the book untitled Blurred Lines (Cops and Docs Book 1) can be fine book to
read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Willie Collins:

Precisely why? Because this Blurred Lines (Cops and Docs Book 1) is an unordinary book that the inside of
the guide waiting for you to snap this but latter it will distress you with the secret that inside. Reading this
book close to it was fantastic author who all write the book in such awesome way makes the content interior
easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for you because
of not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of
positive aspects than the other book possess such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking way.
So , still want to delay having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Harold Morris:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, short story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not striving Blurred Lines (Cops and Docs Book
1) that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading addiction all over
the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world far better then how they react when it
comes to the world. It can't be said constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky man or woman but for
all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for every you who want to start studying as your
good habit, you could pick Blurred Lines (Cops and Docs Book 1) become your starter.

Arlene Miller:

Reading a book to become new life style in this season; every people loves to examine a book. When you go
through a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what types
of book that you have read. In order to get information about your examine, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and soon. The
Blurred Lines (Cops and Docs Book 1) offer you a new experience in looking at a book.
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