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Scale Your Project Management Efforts to Maximize Success!

One size does not fit all in project management. Selecting an approach that is appropriate for the size and
complexity of a project is essential to achieving success. Over-managing a small project can bog it down in
bureaucracy, while a laid-back approach can lead to disaster on a complex project.

Pragmatic Project Management: Five Scalable Steps to Success will help you select the methodologies and
tools that will enable you to expend minimum effort to achieve maximum gain on your project. This clearly
written guide lays the groundwork with a chapter on project sizing and management scaling and follows with
chapters on each of the five essential elements of pragmatic project management:

The project charter
The project team
The project plan
Project issue management
Project status tracking and reporting

Practical tips and a checklist are included at the end of each chapter. Use the checklists as you plan and
execute your project to keep it on track and to scale.

About the Author
David Pratt, PMP, is principal of DHP Project Services, an IT project management consulting firm. He has
more than 20 years experience managing projects of all types and sizes in both the public and private sectors.
He currently teaches project management at the South Puget Sound Community College in Lacey,
Washington, where he helped design the project management certificate program.
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From reader reviews:

Douglas Reece:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a go walking,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book called Pragmatic Project Management:
Five Scalable Steps to Success? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You already know beside you can
spend your time using your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion
or you have additional opinion?

Julie Moore:

The book Pragmatic Project Management: Five Scalable Steps to Success can give more knowledge and also
the precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave the good thing like a book
Pragmatic Project Management: Five Scalable Steps to Success? Wide variety you have a different opinion
about book. But one aim that book can give many information for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to
closer using your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you could give for each other; you
are able to share all of these. Book Pragmatic Project Management: Five Scalable Steps to Success has
simple shape but you know: it has great and large function for you. You can seem the enormous world by
open up and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Jessica Henriquez:

This Pragmatic Project Management: Five Scalable Steps to Success book is simply not ordinary book, you
have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is usually information
inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper you actually read a
lot of information you will get. This particular Pragmatic Project Management: Five Scalable Steps to
Success without we know teach the one who looking at it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't
possibly be worry Pragmatic Project Management: Five Scalable Steps to Success can bring once you are
and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it within your lovely
laptop even mobile phone. This Pragmatic Project Management: Five Scalable Steps to Success having
excellent arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Julie Slocum:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library in order to
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's heart and soul or
real their pastime. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring along with can't
see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we
know that on this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach



Chinese's country. Therefore , this Pragmatic Project Management: Five Scalable Steps to Success can make
you really feel more interested to read.
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