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A Pulitzer Prize–winning journalist takes readers on a surprising tour of America’s biggest export,
our most prodigious product, and our greatest legacy: our trash

The average American produces 102 tons of garbage across a lifetime and $50 billion in squandered riches
are rolled to the curb each year. But our bins are just the starting point for a strange, impressive, mysterious,
and costly journey that may also represent the greatest untapped opportunity of the century.

In Garbology, Edward Humes investigates trash—what’s in it; how much we pay for it; how we manage to
create so much of it; and how some families, communities, and even nations are finding a way back from
waste to discover a new kind of prosperity. Along the way , he introduces a collection of garbage denizens
unlike anyone you’ve ever met: the trash-tracking detectives of MIT, the bulldozer-driving sanitation
workers building Los Angeles’ Garbage Mountain landfill, the artists residing in San Francisco’s dump, and
the family whose annual trash output fills not a dumpster or a trash can, but a single mason jar.

Garbology reveals not just what we throw away, but who we are and where our society is headed. Waste is
the one environmental and economic harm that ordinary working Americans have the power to change—and
prosper in the process.

Garbology is raising awareness of trash consumption and is sparking community-wide action through One
City One Book programs around the country.
It is becoming an increasingly popular addition to high school and college syllabi and is being adopted by
many colleges and universities for First Year Experience programs.
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From reader reviews:

Florence Whitney:

This Garbology: Our Dirty Love Affair with Trash book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it then the
world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is definitely information inside this e-
book incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will
get. This Garbology: Our Dirty Love Affair with Trash without we comprehend teach the one who looking at
it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't become worry Garbology: Our Dirty Love Affair with
Trash can bring if you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' become full because you can have
it with your lovely laptop even cell phone. This Garbology: Our Dirty Love Affair with Trash having very
good arrangement in word and layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Curt Roepke:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the headline Garbology:
Our Dirty Love Affair with Trash suitable to you? Typically the book was written by famous writer in this
era. The actual book untitled Garbology: Our Dirty Love Affair with Trashis a single of several books that
everyone read now. This specific book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this e-book
you will enter the new age that you ever know before. The author explained their concept in the simple way,
and so all of people can easily to know the core of this reserve. This book will give you a wide range of
information about this world now. So that you can see the represented of the world on this book.

Christopher Thompson:

The guide with title Garbology: Our Dirty Love Affair with Trash contains a lot of information that you can
understand it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. That book exist new information the information
that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to
find out how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you with new era of the
internationalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you
want.

Faye Berg:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this Garbology: Our Dirty Love Affair with
Trash e-book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book which can be
understand by anyone who have read the book. Written in good manner for you, dripping every ideas and
producing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still hesitation Garbology: Our Dirty Love
Affair with Trash as good book not merely by the cover but also with the content. This is one book that can
break don't ascertain book by its include, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick this
particular!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to yet
another sixth sense.
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